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From: Jokela, John

To: Carstens. Jay; Mueller, Lynn
Subject: FW: 2019 funds
Date: Thursday, July 25, 2019 2:09:04 PM

So you're aware, the Interlocal 2017-CPU-08, allowing for additional Weatherization repair funds
annually, from CPU, has the $120,000 authorized below. We have been accumulating emails as
evidence of new funding each year.

H:\Contracts\FULLY SIGNED GRANTS - PDF\Clark Public Utilities

Give a reply with any questions, thx!

John Jokela, CPA
Sr. Management Analyst
DEPT OF COMMUNITY SERVICES

phone: 564.397.7883

UPCOMING 0O0O0: 7/17-19, 8/19-23

From: Giese, Jerry

Sent: Thursday, July 25, 2019 1:40 PM
To: Jokela, John

Subject: FW: 2019 funds

John,

| received this from Gretchen 10 days ago. Take a look

From: Gretchen [mailto:Gretchen@clarkpud.com]
Sent: Friday, July 12, 2019 4:09 PM

To: Giese, Jerry

Cc: Deborah K. DePetris

Subject: 2019 funds

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of Clark County. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hello Jerry,

Just reaching back regarding your inquiry about the new weatherization/repair CPU dollars. Here are
the amounts by category that are available as of July 1 2019:
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1. Emergency Heat Repair $45,000
2. Weatherization Related Repairs $45,000
3. Misc. Energy/Water Related Repairs $30,000

Please let me know if there are any additional questions.

Gretchen Alexander
Community Care Manager
360.992.3583

galexander@clarkpud.com
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